
FOI number: HBC_FOI_2019119 
Date FOI Received: 05/02/2019 
Department: Community Services 
Title: Provision of community services 
Description: Details of libraries, youth centres, community centres, Children’s 
centres and subsidised bus routes in 2010/11 and for 2018/19. 
 
 
 
Request:  (As Redacted sent by requestor)  
 
Dear Sir/Madam 

I am requesting the following information under the Freedom of Information Act.  

Not all questions will be applicable to all councils. Please note which questions are based on 

ownership and which questions are based on funding. 

Libraries 

1. Please list the libraries that were owned by the council in 2010/11, if possible including their 

addresses and postcodes 

If the council does not hold information for 2010/11 please provide the requested information for 

the earliest year for which information is held. 

2. Please list the libraries that are owned by the council in 2018/19, if possible including 

their addresses and postcodes 

3. Where a facility listed in response to question 1 is not listed in response to question 2, please 

specify any that were subjected to community transfer 

Youth centres 

4. Please list the youth centres that were owned by the council in 2010/11, if possible including 

their addresses and postcodes 

If the council does not hold information for 2010/11 please provide the requested information for 

the earliest year for which information is held. 

5. Please list the youth centres that are owned by the council in 2018/19, if possible including 

their addresses and postcodes 

6. Where a facility listed in response to question 4 is not listed in response to question 5, please 

specify any that were subjected to community transfer 

Community centres  

7. Please list the community centres that were owned by the council in 2010/11, if possible including 

their addresses and postcodes 



If the council does not hold information for 2010/11 please provide the requested information for 

the earliest year for which information is held. 

8. Please list the community centres that are owned by the council in 2018/19, if possible including 

their addresses and postcodes 

9. Where a facility listed in response to question 7 is not listed in response to question 8, please 

specify any that were subjected to community transfer 

Children's centres 

Please note that this section is based on the funding of centres, including but not limited to centres 

that were/are owned by the council. 

10. Please list the children's centres/Sure Start centres that were funded by the council in 2010/11, if 

possible including their addresses and postcodes 

If the council does not hold information for 2010/11 please provide the requested information for 

the earliest year for which information is held. 

11. Please list the children's centres/Sure Start that are funded by the council in 2018/19, if possible 

including their addresses and postcodes 

12. Where a facility listed in response to question 10 is not listed in response to question 11, please 

specify any that were subjected to community transfer 

Subsidised bus routes 

13. Please list the bus routes that were subsidised by the council in 2010/11, including the operator 

of each route; the operator and route number will suffice 

If the council does not hold information for 2010/11 please provide the requested information for 

the earliest year for which information is held. 

14. Please list the bus routes that are subsidised by the council in 2018/19, including the operator of 

each route; the operator and route number will suffice 

I would like the information sent by email, preferably via an Excel spreadsheet. 

Yours sincerely, 

 
 
 
Response:  (Response as Redacted sent by service)  
 
Libraries 
1. Please list the libraries that were owned by the council in 2010/11, if possible including their 
addresses and postcodes    
None refer to Hertfordshire County Council 
2. Please list the libraries that are owned by the council in 2018/19, if possible including 
their addresses and postcodes  



None refer to Hertfordshire County Council 
3. Where a facility listed in response to question 1 is not listed in response to question 2, please 
specify any that were subjected to community transfer   
Not applicable  
 
Youth centres 
4. Please list the youth centres that were owned by the council in 2010/11, if possible including 
their addresses and postcodes   
None refer to Hertfordshire County Council 
5. Please list the youth centres that are owned by the council in 2018/19, if possible including 
their addresses and postcodes   
None refer to Hertfordshire County Council 
6. Where a facility listed in response to question 4 is not listed in response to question 5, please 
specify any that were subjected to community transfer 
Not applicable  
 
Community centres  
7. Please list the community centres that were owned by the council in 2010/11, if possible including 
their addresses and postcodes   
This information is published on the council’s website and is applicable for 2010/11. 
https://www.hertsmere.gov.uk/Community/Community-Information/Community-Centres-and-
Facilities.aspx  
If the council does not hold information for 2010/11 please provide the requested information for 
the earliest year for which information is held. 
8. Please list the community centres that are owned by the council in 2018/19, if possible including 
their addresses and postcodes 
This information is published on the council’s website and is applicable for 2018/19. 
https://www.hertsmere.gov.uk/Community/Community-Information/Community-Centres-and-
Facilities.aspx 
9. Where a facility listed in response to question 7 is not listed in response to question 8, please 
specify any that were subjected to community transfer  
Not applicable  
 
Children's centres 
10. Please list the children's centres/Sure Start centres that were funded by the council in 2010/11, if 
possible including their addresses and postcodes   
None refer to Hertfordshire County Council 
11. Please list the children's centres/Sure Start that are funded by the council in 2018/19, if possible 
including their addresses and postcodes  
None refer to Hertfordshire County Council 
12. Where a facility listed in response to question 10 is not listed in response to question 11, please 
specify any that were subjected to community transfer  Not applicable  
 
Subsidised bus routes 
13. Please list the bus routes that were subsidised by the council in 2010/11, including the operator 
of each route; the operator and route number will suffice  None refer to Hertfordshire County 
Council 
14. Please list the bus routes that are subsidised by the council in 2018/19, including the operator of 
each route; the operator and route number will suffice None refer to Hertfordshire County Council 
 

https://www.hertsmere.gov.uk/Community/Community-Information/Community-Centres-and-Facilities.aspx
https://www.hertsmere.gov.uk/Community/Community-Information/Community-Centres-and-Facilities.aspx
https://www.hertsmere.gov.uk/Community/Community-Information/Community-Centres-and-Facilities.aspx
https://www.hertsmere.gov.uk/Community/Community-Information/Community-Centres-and-Facilities.aspx


If you have any queries about the processing of your request then please do not hesitate to contact 
me.  Further information explaining the Council's process for responding to information requests 
together with a complaints/appeals procedure is available in our reception or via our website at: 
http://www.hertsmere.gov.uk/councildemocracy/accesstoinformation/ 
 
The Information Commissioner oversees the application of the Freedom of Information Act.  You 
may contact the Information Commissioner at: 
 
Information Commissioners Office 
Wycliffe House, Water Lane                                                            
Wilmslow  
Cheshire    SK9 5AF 
Telephone: 01625 545700 
Website:  www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk 
 
Please include the above reference number on all correspondence related to this request. 
Thank you for your request. 
 
Kind regards 
 
Information Services 
Hertsmere Borough Council | Civic Offices | Elstree Way | Borehamwood | Herts | WD6 
1WA 

 

http://www.hertsmere.gov.uk/councildemocracy/accesstoinformation/
http://www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk/

