FOI number: HBC_FOI_2019023
Date FOI Received: 09/01/2019

Department: Parking Services
Title: Parking permits
Description: Number of residential parking permits applied for, rejected, roads

covered and revenues raised per year between 2016/17 to 2018/19.

Request: (As Redacted sent by requestor)

| would like to make a request under the Freedom of Information Act (2000) into parking
permits in your council.

The details of the request are outlined below.

Q1. How many applications for residential parking permits were made in your council
over the following timeframes?

o 2016/17

e 2017/18

e 2018/19 (Year to Date)

Q2. How many applications for residential parking permits were rejected in your
council over the following timeframes?

e 2016/17

e 2017/18

e 2018/19 (Year to Date)

Q3. How much revenue did you earn from issuing residential parking permits in the
following timeframes?

o 2016/17

e 2017/18

e 2018/19 (Year to Date)

Q4. How many roads in your council required a parking permit in the following
timeframes?

e 2016/17

e 2017/18

e 2018/19 (Year to Date)

Response: (Response as Redacted sent by service)

Please see table below:

2016/17 2017/18 2018/19
Q1. Total number of parking permit applications 3.613 3,594 1,771 as of
made 17/1/19

Q2. Total number of parking permit applications | Do not hold | Do not hold | Do not hold
rejected this data this data this data




71,660 as of

Q3. Total revenue from parking permits 98,214 96,021 17/1/19

Q4. Total number of roads requiring parking

: 160 160 160
permits

If you have any queries about the processing of your request then please do not hesitate to
contact me. Further information explaining the Council's process for responding to
information requests together with a complaints/appeals procedure is available in our
reception or via our website at:

https://www.hertsmere.gov.uk/Your-Council/Official-Publications--Guides--Policies/Access-
to-Information.aspx

The Information Commissioner oversees the application of the Freedom of Information
Act. You may contact the Information Commissioner at:

Information Commissioners Office

Woycliffe House, Water Lane

Wilmslow

Cheshire SK9 5AF

Telephone: 01625 545700

Website: www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk

Please include the above reference number on all correspondence related to this request.
Thank you for your request.
Kind regards

Information Services
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